
[NADINE URCIUOLI [CLUB NAUTIQUE]] VOLVO D4-3001-F A441331 - STARBOARD DIESEL ENGINE
Sample No: VPA051751
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3

Helmuts Marine Service619 Canal StreetSAN RAFAEL, CAUS  94901-3545Contact: NADINE URCIUOLISERVICE@HELMUTSMARINE.COMT:  x:F:  x:
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VP152741Unique No: 10649613Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 20 Sep 2023
Report Id: VP152741 [WUSCAR] 05953654 (Generated: 09/21/2023 08:46:29) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: NADINE URCIUOLI - VP152741

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA051751 VPA022882 VPA031820 VPA023277Sample Date 07 Sep 2023 13 Aug 2021 26 Oct 2020 28 Nov 2018Machine Hours 1975 1460 1258 882Oil Hours 1975 202 200 261Oil Changed Changed Changed Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 100°C cSt 13.3 13.2 13.4 13.69Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.3 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 61 65 65 61
 CONTAMINATION

Soot % % 0.3 0.2 0.3 0.3Nitration (PA) % 60 63 63 59Sulfation (PA) % 55 58 59 55Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 4 5 5 6Sodium ppm 2 2 3 3Potassium ppm 1 0 0 <1
 WEAR METALS

Iron ppm 27 18 21 22Copper ppm 6 4 6 10Lead ppm 1 <1 1 3Tin ppm <1 0 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 2 2 5 4Chromium ppm 2 2 1 2Molybdenum ppm 61 55 61 60Nickel ppm 5 4 4 5Titanium ppm <1 <1 <1 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm <1 <1 0 0
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 1219 1045 1004 1023Magnesium ppm 1102 972 923 944Zinc ppm 1389 1135 1133 1088Phosphorus ppm 1102 991 968 982Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 0 7 1 4

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP152741 [WUSCAR] 05953654 (Generated: 09/21/2023 08:46:32) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: NADINE URCIUOLI - VP152741
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO D4-3001-F A441331\Starboard Diesel Engine [VPA051751] 07 Sep 2023 @ 1975.0 hrs

