
ZF 42069R - INBOARD - STARBOARD GEARBOX
Sample No: VPA020413
Oil Type: SHELL ROTELLA T 40

CAROLINA MARINE DIESELPO BOX 24159HILTON HEAD, SCUS  29925Contact: KEVIN JACKSONcmdieselsc@gmail.comT: (843)830-9202F: (843)681-9976
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.Copper andlead ppm levels are abnormal. Thereis no indication of any contaminationin the oil. The oil is no longerserviceable as a result of theabnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: CARHILSCUnique No: 10658407Signed: Angela BorellaReport Date: 22 Sep 2023
Report Id: CARHILSC [WUSCAR] 05957194 (Generated: 09/25/2023 10:04:18) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KEVIN JACKSON - CARHILSC

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA020413 --- --- ---Sample Date 12 Sep 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 664 --- --- ---Oil Hours 100 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 103 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Silicon ppm 7 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 37 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 4 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 28 --- --- ---Iron ppm 38 --- --- ---Copper ppm 476 --- --- ---Lead ppm 172 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 78 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 2713 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 39 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 910 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 935 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 65 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: CARHILSC [WUSCAR] 05957194 (Generated: 09/25/2023 10:04:20) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KEVIN JACKSON - CARHILSC
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	ZF ZF 42069R - INBOARD\Starboard Gearbox [VPA020413] 12 Sep 2023 @ 664.0 hrs

