
[PAUL WALSER [JOSH]] VOLVO PENTA A1210025 - STERNDRIVE - CENTER GEARBOX
Sample No: VPA003945
Oil Type: VOLVO PENTA 10W40 SYN

The Boat Rack Inc7865 Spinnaker Bay DrSHERRILLS FORD, NCUS  28673-9267Contact: Rob Helmsbriankrueger@theboatrack.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Oil and filter change atthe time of sampling has been noted.Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. Elemental level of silicon(Si) above normal indicating ingressof seal material. The condition of theoil is acceptable for the time inservice.

Depot: VP154485Unique No: 10662637Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 28 Sep 2023
Report Id: VP154485 [WUSCAR] 05961424 (Generated: 09/28/2023 11:31:41) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Rob Helms - VP154485

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA003945 --- --- ---Sample Date 22 Sep 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 13 --- --- ---Oil Hours 13 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 90.1 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Silicon ppm 68 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 10 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 25 --- --- ---Iron ppm 21 --- --- ---Copper ppm 61 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 4 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 2 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 41 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 6 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 2604 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 42 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 765 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 682 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 13 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP154485 [WUSCAR] 05961424 (Generated: 09/28/2023 11:31:43) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Rob Helms - VP154485
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA A1210025 - STERNDRIVE\Center Gearbox [VPA003945] 22 Sep 2023 @ 13.0 hrs

