
[[DAVE H14762]] CUMMINS K130593379 - GENSET
Sample No: VPA036434
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN

Walstrom Marine501 Bay StreetHARBOR SPRINGS, MIUS  49740Contact: MARK LEWISmlewis@walstrom.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VP154879Unique No: 10669202Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 27 Sep 2023
Report Id: VP154879 [WUSCAR] 05962651 (Generated: 09/27/2023 14:43:45) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MARK LEWIS - VP154879

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA036434 --- --- ---Sample Date 22 Sep 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 100°C cSt 13.88 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 63 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Soot % % 0.1 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 49 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 53 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 7 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 7 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

Iron ppm 6 --- --- ---Copper ppm <1 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 0 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 2144 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 20 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1223 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 999 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 216 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP154879 [WUSCAR] 05962651 (Generated: 09/27/2023 14:43:48) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MARK LEWIS - VP154879
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	CUMMINS CUMMINS K130593379\Genset [VPA036434] 22 Sep 2023 @ .0 hrs

