
[JACK SIMON [TOM]] ZF 20092553 - INBOARD - PORT GEARBOX
Sample No: VPA056078
Oil Type: KENDALL SUPER-D 3 SAE 30

ADMIRALTY MARINE2775 KURTZ ST, STE 12SAN DIEGO, CAUS  92110Contact: Terry AlbeeTALBEE@ADMIRALTYMARINE.NETT: F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal forOEM. There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VP151529Unique No: 10673161Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 03 Oct 2023
Report Id: VP151529 [WUSCAR] 05966610 (Generated: 10/03/2023 09:30:30) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Terry Albee - VP151529

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA056078 VPA056352 --- ---Sample Date 29 Sep 2023 06 Sep 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 521 510 --- ---Oil Hours 9 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Not Changd --- ---Sample Status NORMAL SEVERE --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 94.7 82.4 --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Silicon ppm 4 9 --- ---Sodium ppm <1 2 --- ---Potassium ppm 1 5 --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 20 22 --- ---Iron ppm 10 36 --- ---Copper ppm 119 458 --- ---Lead ppm 49 172 --- ---Tin ppm 11 39 --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 7 --- ---Chromium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 5 27 --- ---Nickel ppm 0 0 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm <1 <1 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 3453 2711 --- ---Magnesium ppm 48 36 --- ---Zinc ppm 1252 1207 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1086 1046 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 17 29 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP151529 [WUSCAR] 05966610 (Generated: 10/03/2023 09:30:32) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Terry Albee - VP151529
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	ZF ZF 20092553 - INBOARD\Port Gearbox [VPA056078] 29 Sep 2023 @ 521.0 hrs

