
[DENNIS GROUL] MERCURY 0M971768 - ZUES LOWER - STARBOARD GEARBOX
Sample No: VPA056017
Oil Type: MERCURY SAE 90

COASTAL CAROLINA YACHT SALES145 LOCKWOOD BLVDCHARLESTON, SCUS  29403Contact: STEVE VASASsteve@ccyachtsales.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. Resample atthe next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is a lightconcentration of water present in theoil. Moderate concentration of visibledirt/debris present in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VP568144Unique No: 10675990Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 04 Oct 2023
Report Id: VP568144 [WUSCAR] 05969439 (Generated: 10/04/2023 16:28:36) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEVE VASAS - VP568144

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA056017 VPA037679 VPA031273 ---Sample Date 02 Oct 2023 14 Jan 2022 26 May 2021 ---Machine Hours 904 861 762 ---Oil Hours 0 0 0 ---Oil Changed N/A Changed N/A ---Sample Status ABNORMAL SEVERE ABNORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 153.4 155 166 ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % 0.310 1.00 0.317 ---Silicon ppm 3 7 2 ---Sodium ppm 24 43 45 ---Potassium ppm 2 3 3 ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 27 51 57 ---Iron ppm 129 309 138 ---Copper ppm 12 20 6 ---Lead ppm <1 1 1 ---Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Aluminum ppm 2 4 1 ---Chromium ppm 1 3 2 ---Molybdenum ppm 48 54 80 ---Nickel ppm 2 2 <1 ---Titanium ppm 0 <1 0 ---Silver ppm 0 <1 <1 ---Manganese ppm 2 3 2 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 129 326 323 ---Magnesium ppm 4 8 9 ---Zinc ppm 28 54 16 ---Phosphorus ppm 269 363 370 ---Barium ppm 0 0 0 ---Boron ppm 2 17 11 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP568144 [WUSCAR] 05969439 (Generated: 10/04/2023 16:28:38) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEVE VASAS - VP568144
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	MERCURY MERCURY 0M971768 - ZUES LOWER\Starboard Gearbox [VPA056017] 02 Oct 2023 @ 904.0 hrs

