
[AMERICAN MARINE [M772881]] 2006032404 - PORT COOLANT
Sample No: VPA051750
Oil Type: VOLVO COOLANT (GREEN)

INTERSTATE POWER SYSTEMS2901 E 78TH STMINNEAPOLIS, MNUS  55425Contact: BRADY GARBRECHTbrady.garbrecht@istate.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
We recommend drain/flush system,and refill with 50/50 antifreeze watermixture. We advise that you replenishthe supplemental coolant additives(SCAs) and add per manufacturer`srecommendations. Sediment present.Glycol and nitrite levels areacceptable. The pH level of this fluidis within the acceptable limits.

Depot: VP1103105Unique No: 10683846Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 12 Oct 2023
Report Id: VP1103105 [WUSCAR] 05971896 (Generated: 10/13/2023 09:46:48) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRADY GARBRECHT - VP1103105

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA051750 --- --- ---Sample Date 02 Oct 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 523 --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITION

pH Scale 0-14 8.48 --- --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm 1240 --- --- ---Percentage Glycol % 53.7 --- --- ---Freezing Point °C -43 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Coolant Appearance sediment --- --- ---Coolant Color Yllow --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP1103105 [WUSCAR] 05971896 (Generated: 10/13/2023 09:46:50) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRADY GARBRECHT - VP1103105
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA 2006032404\Port Coolant [VPA051750] 02 Oct 2023 @ 523.0 hrs

