
VOLVO PENTA 2071135392 - STARBOARD DIESEL ENGINE
Sample No: VPA049818
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 15W40

FLORIDA DETROIT DIESEL - 531006 - 11257741128 CHESTNUT AVEPANAMA CITY, FLUS  32401Contact: RICHARD ROBERTSri.roberts@ssss.comT: (850)763-7656F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of the coolant leak. Check forlow coolant level. We recommendthat you drain the oil and perform afilter service on this component if notalready done. We advise that youinspect for the source(s) of wear. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.Piston, ringand cylinder wear is indicated.Sodium and/or potassium levels arehigh. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil.

Depot: VPFLOPANUnique No: 10687239Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 13 Oct 2023
Report Id: VPFLOPAN [WUSCAR] 05975289 (Generated: 10/17/2023 16:42:12) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RICHARD ROBERTS - VPFLOPAN

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA049818 --- --- ---Sample Date 09 Oct 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 667 --- --- ---Oil Hours 20 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 100°C cSt 13.8 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 7.7 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 59 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Soot % % 0.1 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 43 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 51 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 9 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 111 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 9 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

Iron ppm 224 --- --- ---Copper ppm 86 --- --- ---Lead ppm 17 --- --- ---Tin ppm 1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 133 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 7 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 6 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 2 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 1558 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 131 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1031 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1027 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 126 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VPFLOPAN [WUSCAR] 05975289 (Generated: 10/17/2023 16:42:15) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RICHARD ROBERTS - VPFLOPAN
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA 2071135392\Starboard Diesel Engine [VPA049818] 09 Oct 2023 @ 666.5 hrs

