
[BAKER, MATT] VOLVO PENTA 51120150648 - INBOARD - PORT GEARBOX
Sample No: VPA045851
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN

Outstanding MarinePO Box 274GALENA, MDUS  21635Contact: Ronda Bolingerrlwb@verizon.netT: F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Bearingand/or bushing wear is indicated.Gear wear is indicated. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VP153685Unique No: 10698719Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 19 Oct 2023
Report Id: VP153685 [WUSCAR] 05981424 (Generated: 10/23/2023 01:01:01) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Ronda Bolinger - VP153685

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA045851 --- --- ---Sample Date 12 Oct 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status ATTENTION --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 23.4 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Silicon ppm 6 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 4 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 36 --- --- ---Iron ppm 163 --- --- ---Copper ppm 138 --- --- ---Lead ppm 161 --- --- ---Tin ppm 2 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 4 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 67 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 21 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 166 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 164 --- --- ---Barium ppm 2 --- --- ---Boron ppm 80 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP153685 [WUSCAR] 05981424 (Generated: 10/23/2023 01:01:03) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Ronda Bolinger - VP153685
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA 51120150648 - INBOARD\Port Gearbox [VPA045851] 12 Oct 2023 @ .0 hrs

