
20142663 - INBOARD - GEARBOX
Sample No: VPA036973
Oil Type: ATF

ADVANCED DIESEL1029 INDUSTRIAL BLVD, UNIT 2NAPLES, FLUS  34104Contact: KEITH SPICERkeith_advanceddiesel@yahoo.comT: (239)580-8731F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Thealuminum level is abnormal. Thecopper level is abnormal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VPADVNAPUnique No: 10699876Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 20 Oct 2023
Report Id: VPADVNAP [WUSCAR] 05982581 (Generated: 10/20/2023 13:05:12) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KEITH SPICER - VPADVNAP

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA036973 --- --- ---Sample Date 12 Oct 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 40 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 27.6 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Silicon ppm 11 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 17 --- --- ---Iron ppm 54 --- --- ---Copper ppm 153 --- --- ---Lead ppm 12 --- --- ---Tin ppm 1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 21 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 85 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 9 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 33 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 153 --- --- ---Barium ppm 1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 61 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VPADVNAP [WUSCAR] 05982581 (Generated: 10/20/2023 13:05:15) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KEITH SPICER - VPADVNAP
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA 20142663 - INBOARD\Gearbox [VPA036973] 12 Oct 2023 @ 40.0 hrs

