
[TRAVIS HOLT [SAM]] VOLVO PENTA 7011314948 - PORT COOLANT
Sample No: VPA059148
Oil Type: VOLVO COOLANT VCS (YELLOW)

Endor Marine LLC - Coastal Marine - 1521244300 11th Ave. NWSEATTLE, WAUS  98107Contact: WILLOW YANARELLAservice@coastalmarineengine.comT: (206)784-3703F: (206)784-8823
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. The fluid is suitable forfurther service. No evidence of oilpresent in the coolant. There is noindication of any contamination inthe coolant. Carboxylate test failed.The glycol level is acceptable. The pHlevel of this fluid is within theacceptable limits.

Depot: VP794951Unique No: 10702581Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 24 Oct 2023
Report Id: VP794951 [WUSCAR] 05985286 (Generated: 10/26/2023 21:46:30) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: WILLOW YANARELLA - VP794951

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA059148 --- --- ---Sample Date 17 Oct 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 2518 --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITION

pH Scale 0-14 8.15 --- --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm 0 --- --- ---Percentage Glycol % 40.4 --- --- ---Freezing Point °C -13 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Coolant Appearance normal --- --- ---Coolant Color Yllow --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP794951 [WUSCAR] 05985286 (Generated: 10/26/2023 21:46:32) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: WILLOW YANARELLA - VP794951
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA 7011314948\Port Coolant [VPA059148] 17 Oct 2023 @ 2518.0 hrs

