
VOLVO PENTA NOT GIVEN VPA048649 - INBOARD GEARBOX
Sample No: VPA048649
Oil Type: ATF

SUNCOAST DIESEL MARINE6341 PORTER ROAD, SUITE 6SARASOTA, FLUS  34240Contact: SERVICE MANAGERinfo@suncoastdmi.comT: (941)342-0033F: 
Diagnosis
We recommend that you drain the oilfrom the component if this has notalready been done. We advise thatyou inspect for the source(s) of wear.We recommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.Gear wear isindicated. Moderate concentration ofvisible metal present. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The oil viscosity is higher thannormal. This plus the additive levelsindicates the addition of a differentbrand, or type of oil. Confirm oil type.

Depot: VP705283Unique No: 10708532Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 24 Oct 2023
Report Id: VP705283 [WUSCAR] 05985870 (Generated: 10/24/2023 13:16:52) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER - VP705283

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA048649 --- --- ---Sample Date 19 Oct 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 3885 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 136 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Silicon ppm 16 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 17 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 11 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 148 --- --- ---Iron ppm 626 --- --- ---Copper ppm 173 --- --- ---Lead ppm 6 --- --- ---Tin ppm 6 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 8 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 10 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 55 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 3 --- --- ---Silver ppm 3 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 7 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 38 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 22 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 240 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1284 --- --- ---Barium ppm 18 --- --- ---Boron ppm 187 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP705283 [WUSCAR] 05985870 (Generated: 10/24/2023 13:16:54) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER - VP705283
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA NOT GIVEN VPA048649\Inboard Gearbox [VPA048649] 19 Oct 2023 @ 3885.0 hrs

