
[[R815349]] VOLVO PENTA 2004028834 - PORT DIESEL ENGINE
Sample No: VPA050708
Oil Type: VOLVO PENTA SAE 15W40

Power Products Systems LLC90 Bay State RoadWAKEFIELD, MAUS  01880Contact: Andy Tassinariatassinari@nedda.comT: (781)844-0680F: (781)246-1812
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Thealuminum level is abnormal. Pistonwear is indicated. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: VP153550Unique No: 10708791Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 25 Oct 2023
Report Id: VP153550 [WUSCAR] 05986129 (Generated: 10/26/2023 08:06:06) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Andy Tassinari - VP153550

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA050708 --- --- ---Sample Date 18 Oct 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1003 --- --- ---Oil Hours 50 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 100°C cSt 12.9 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 10.0 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 60 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Soot % % 0.1 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 49 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 53 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 23 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 11 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

Iron ppm 35 --- --- ---Copper ppm 7 --- --- ---Lead ppm 14 --- --- ---Tin ppm 3 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 20 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 2 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 61 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 1096 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 964 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1339 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1087 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 6 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP153550 [WUSCAR] 05986129 (Generated: 10/26/2023 08:06:08) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Andy Tassinari - VP153550
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA 2004028834\Port Diesel Engine [VPA050708] 18 Oct 2023 @ 1003.0 hrs

