
VOLVO PENTA 3194002671 - PORT IPS
Sample No: VPA041669
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN

JON DIESEL LLC4915 241ST EMYAKKA CITY, FLUS  34251Contact: Jon Marquettejondieselllc@gmail.comT: (941)780-1330F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you inspect for thesource(s) of wear. We recommend anearly resample to monitor thiscondition. Please specify the brand,type, and viscosity of the oil on yournext sample.Iron ppm levels areabnormal. Aluminum and copperppm levels are marginal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VPJONMYAUnique No: 10710211Signed: Angela BorellaReport Date: 25 Oct 2023
Report Id: VPJONMYA [WUSCAR] 05987549 (Generated: 10/26/2023 08:46:49) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Jon Marquette - VPJONMYA

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA041669 --- --- ---Sample Date 20 Oct 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1390 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 104 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Silicon ppm 17 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 31 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 4 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 35 --- --- ---Iron ppm 273 --- --- ---Copper ppm 13 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 20 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 2 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 4 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 12 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 6 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 54 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1368 --- --- ---Barium ppm 10 --- --- ---Boron ppm 313 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VPJONMYA [WUSCAR] 05987549 (Generated: 10/26/2023 08:46:50) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Jon Marquette - VPJONMYA
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA 3194002671\Port IPS [VPA041669] 20 Oct 2023 @ 1390.0 hrs

