
[DICENSO [JB]] VOLVO PENTA DICENSO (S/N NOT GIVEN) - PORT IPS
Sample No: VPA036963
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 75W90

Point Judith Marina360 Gooseberry RoadWAKEFIELD, RIUS  02879Contact: MATT ST. ANGELOservice@pjmarina.com;canastasio@wearcheckusa.comT: (401)789-7189F: (401)783-5350
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is a lightconcentration of water present in theoil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VP153811Unique No: 10712122Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 31 Oct 2023
Report Id: VP153811 [WUSCAR] 05989460 (Generated: 10/31/2023 13:11:03) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MATT ST. ANGELO - VP153811

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA036963 --- --- ---Sample Date 18 Oct 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 644 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 107 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % 0.224 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 1 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 4 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 16 --- --- ---Iron ppm 47 --- --- ---Copper ppm 5 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 5 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 3 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1360 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 292 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP153811 [WUSCAR] 05989460 (Generated: 10/31/2023 13:11:05) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MATT ST. ANGELO - VP153811
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA DICENSO (S/N NOT GIVEN)\Port IPS [VPA036963] 18 Oct 2023 @ 644.0 hrs

