
[SCOTT GLAZEBROOK [7717402]] ZF 50630640922 - INBOARD - CENTER GEARBOX
Sample No: VPA055141
Oil Type: CHEVRON AUTOMATIC TRANS FLUID MD-3

Pacific Power Group - VP9815347215 S 228th StKent, WAUS  98032Contact: PAT RYANpryan@pacificpowergroup.comT: (253)520-5163F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VP99031103Unique No: 10722989Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 01 Nov 2023
Report Id: VP99031103 [WUSCAR] 05994629 (Generated: 11/01/2023 19:25:23) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PAT RYAN - VP99031103

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA055141 VPA046497 VPA028591 VPA027005Sample Date 19 Oct 2023 14 Feb 2023 12 Nov 2021 26 Sep 2019Machine Hours 0 2374 2301 2127Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 27.6 27.0 27.2 25.6
 CONTAMINATION

Silicon ppm 1 3 2 4Sodium ppm 3 2 <1 <1Potassium ppm 0 0 0 2
 WEAR METALS

PQ 12 20 19 24Iron ppm 2 11 15 22Copper ppm 3 4 10 16Lead ppm 0 1 6 17Tin ppm 0 0 0 <1Aluminum ppm <1 <1 1 2Chromium ppm 0 0 0 <1Molybdenum ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Nickel ppm <1 0 0 0Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 <1 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 7 18 6 8Magnesium ppm 13 7 <1 0Zinc ppm 0 16 <1 6Phosphorus ppm 145 148 147 153Barium ppm 0 0 0 8Boron ppm 59 61 55 59

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP99031103 [WUSCAR] 05994629 (Generated: 11/01/2023 19:25:33) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PAT RYAN - VP99031103
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	ZF ZF 50630640922 - INBOARD\Center Gearbox [VPA055141] 19 Oct 2023 @ .0 hrs

