
[JACOBS [BUD]] VOLVO 2006007207 - STARBOARD DIESEL ENGINE
Sample No: VPA036868
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3

Point Judith Marina360 Gooseberry RoadWAKEFIELD, RIUS  02879Contact: MATT ST. ANGELOservice@pjmarina.com;canastasio@wearcheckusa.comT: (401)789-7189F: (401)783-5350
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VP153811Unique No: 10723685Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 02 Nov 2023
Report Id: VP153811 [WUSCAR] 05995325 (Generated: 11/06/2023 16:54:51) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MATT ST. ANGELO - VP153811

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA036868 VPA041075 VPA032968 VPA024129Sample Date 28 Oct 2023 02 Oct 2022 11 Nov 2020 25 Oct 2018Machine Hours 779 739 635 523Oil Hours 0 0 112 41Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 100°C cSt 14.5 13.6 13.6 13.99Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 8.6 10.8 --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 69 73 66 44
 CONTAMINATION

Soot % % 0.1 0.1 0.1 0.1Nitration (PA) % 58 73 68 53Sulfation (PA) % 56 61 56 40Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 4 6 8 13Sodium ppm 4 1 4 3Potassium ppm 8 <1 <1 0
 WEAR METALS

Iron ppm 26 43 39 27Copper ppm 2 4 7 8Lead ppm <1 4 4 3Tin ppm <1 <1 1 0Aluminum ppm 28 71 25 14Chromium ppm 3 6 3 2Molybdenum ppm 6 57 60 62Nickel ppm <1 2 2 2Titanium ppm <1 0 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 0 <1 <1 1Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 1928 1011 1006 1182Magnesium ppm 98 915 912 1104Zinc ppm 1160 1189 1094 1118Phosphorus ppm 967 998 1006 1037Barium ppm <1 0 0 <1Boron ppm 172 1 2 1

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP153811 [WUSCAR] 05995325 (Generated: 11/06/2023 16:54:54) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MATT ST. ANGELO - VP153811
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO 2006007207\Starboard Diesel Engine [VPA036868] 28 Oct 2023 @ 779.0 hrs

