
[JOE ZATTAR [353283]] MERCRUISER 20312619 - ZEUS/ZF - PORT TRANSMISSION
Sample No: VPA048448
Oil Type: MERCURY 0W30

Skipper Marine of Ohio, LLC6801 E. Harbor Rd., 6801 East Harbor Rd.MARBLEHEAD, OHUS  43440Contact: Glenn Pollockglenn@skipperbuds.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
The fluid change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Thecopper level is abnormal. All othercomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the fluid. Thecondition of the fluid is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: VP494046Unique No: 10724360Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 03 Nov 2023
Report Id: VP494046 [WUSCAR] 05996000 (Generated: 11/03/2023 11:26:53) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Glenn Pollock - VP494046

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA048448 --- --- ---Sample Date 27 Oct 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ATTENTION --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 39.4 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Silicon ppm 4 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 0 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 6 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 102 --- --- ---Iron ppm 189 --- --- ---Copper ppm 326 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 2 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 2 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 50 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 2258 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 11 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 785 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 729 --- --- ---Barium ppm 5 --- --- ---Boron ppm 218 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP494046 [WUSCAR] 05996000 (Generated: 11/03/2023 11:26:55) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Glenn Pollock - VP494046
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	MERCRUISER MERCRUISER 20312619 - ZEUS/ZF\Port Transmission [VPA048448] 27 Oct 2023 @ .0 hrs

