
[BRIAN TEDESCHI [533225]] VOLVO PENTA 3940022222 - PORT IPS
Sample No: VPA056837
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 75W90

Jas Marine Service Inc3131 SW 2Nd Ave.FORT LAUDERDALE, FLUS  33315Contact: JASON TOLEDOjason@jasmarine.comT: (954)462-1112F: 
Diagnosis
We recommend that you drain the oilfrom the component if this has notalready been done. We advise thatyou inspect for the source(s) of wear.We recommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.Gear wear isindicated. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The oilis no longer serviceable as a result ofthe abnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: VP426065Unique No: 10724772Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 03 Nov 2023
Report Id: VP426065 [WUSCAR] 05996412 (Generated: 11/03/2023 16:44:04) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: JASON TOLEDO - VP426065

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA056837 VPA036151 --- ---Sample Date 31 Oct 2023 21 Oct 2021 --- ---Machine Hours 2053 0 --- ---Oil Hours 0 150 --- ---Oil Changed N/A Not Changd --- ---Sample Status SEVERE NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 101 104 --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Silicon ppm 23 14 --- ---Sodium ppm 48 5 --- ---Potassium ppm 6 <1 --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 22 25 --- ---Iron ppm 424 139 --- ---Copper ppm 34 8 --- ---Lead ppm 0 <1 --- ---Tin ppm 0 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm 8 4 --- ---Chromium ppm 3 1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 --- ---Nickel ppm 5 2 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 <1 --- ---Manganese ppm 9 2 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 17 4 --- ---Magnesium ppm 21 2 --- ---Zinc ppm 75 3 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1309 1376 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 263 343 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP426065 [WUSCAR] 05996412 (Generated: 11/03/2023 16:44:06) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: JASON TOLEDO - VP426065
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA 3940022222\Port IPS [VPA056837] 31 Oct 2023 @ 2053.0 hrs

