
[LEE HOWLEY [3754]] VOLVO PENTA 3200000514 - STARBOARD IPS
Sample No: VPA055384
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 75W90

WESTERN BRANCH DIESEL6881 BULLDOG DR NCHARLESTON, SCUS  29406Contact: MICHAEL JORDANmdjordan@wbdiesel.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VP1165983Unique No: 10727722Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 07 Nov 2023
Report Id: VP1165983 [WUSCAR] 05999362 (Generated: 11/08/2023 07:33:14) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MICHAEL JORDAN - VP1165983

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA055384 --- --- ---Sample Date 01 Nov 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 110 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Silicon ppm <1 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 24 --- --- ---Iron ppm 92 --- --- ---Copper ppm 15 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 3 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm <1 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 11 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1332 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 300 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP1165983 [WUSCAR] 05999362 (Generated: 11/08/2023 07:33:16) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MICHAEL JORDAN - VP1165983
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA 3200000514\Starboard IPS [VPA055384] 01 Nov 2023 @ .0 hrs

