
[RICHARD FISCHMAN [MATTHEW DOW]] VOLVO PENTA 2006010917 - PORT DIESEL ENGINE
Sample No: VPA056591
Oil Type: VALVOLINE PREMIUM BLUE

Mobile Marine Services Inc01032 Advance Rd SouthEAST JORDAN, MIUS  49727Contact: Duane Kujatmobilemarine@twin-valley.netT: PhoneF: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VP443016Unique No: 10742644Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 16 Nov 2023
Report Id: VP443016 [WUSCAR] 06008882 (Generated: 11/30/2023 10:05:35) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Duane Kujat - VP443016

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA056591 VPA042834 VPA035584 VPA030222Sample Date 01 Sep 2023 17 Oct 2022 01 Nov 2021 16 Oct 2019Machine Hours 932 865 801 716Oil Hours 67 64 85 93Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 100°C cSt 14.4 14.3 14.3 14.8Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.1 10.4 9.7 ---Oxidation (PA) % 75 79 82 81
 CONTAMINATION

Water % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.1 0.1 0.2 0.2Nitration (PA) % 71 77 85 83Sulfation (PA) % 58 61 61 60Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 3 3 2 3Sodium ppm 2 3 5 6Potassium ppm 0 0 0 4
 WEAR METALS

Iron ppm 3 10 9 8Copper ppm 1 3 6 5Lead ppm 0 <1 2 <1Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 1 <1 0 1Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 43 45 48 46Nickel ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Titanium ppm 0 0 <1 2Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 1098 1384 1608 1538Magnesium ppm 809 667 640 659Zinc ppm 881 1036 1129 1151Phosphorus ppm 673 882 1030 940Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 40 62 50 42

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP443016 [WUSCAR] 06008882 (Generated: 11/30/2023 10:05:38) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Duane Kujat - VP443016
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA 2006010917\Port Diesel Engine [VPA056591] 01 Sep 2023 @ 932.0 hrs

