
[RICHARD FISCHMAN [MATTHEW DOW]] VOLVO PENTA 3102253581 - STERNDRIVE - STARBOARD GEARBOX
Sample No: VPA056587
Oil Type: VOLVO PENTA GL-5 SAE 75W90

Mobile Marine Services Inc01032 Advance Rd SouthEAST JORDAN, MIUS  49727Contact: Duane Kujatmobilemarine@twin-valley.netT: PhoneF: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VP443016Unique No: 10742954Signed: Angela BorellaReport Date: 17 Nov 2023
Report Id: VP443016 [WUSCAR] 06009192 (Generated: 11/30/2023 10:05:52) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Duane Kujat - VP443016

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA056587 VPA055911 VPA017538 ---Sample Date 05 Sep 2023 14 Apr 2023 18 Oct 2018 ---Machine Hours 932 902 661 ---Oil Hours 67 63 79 ---Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL ATTENTION ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 162 159 102.8 ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % NEG NEG 0.478 ---Silicon ppm 2 2 7 ---Sodium ppm 0 0 2 ---Potassium ppm <1 1 <1 ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 26 33 148 ---Iron ppm 19 35 233 ---Copper ppm <1 <1 1 ---Lead ppm 0 0 <1 ---Tin ppm 0 0 <1 ---Aluminum ppm 2 0 8 ---Chromium ppm <1 <1 4 ---Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 0 ---Nickel ppm <1 <1 5 ---Titanium ppm 0 0 3 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm 0 <1 7 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 <1 ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 11 8 10 ---Magnesium ppm 675 512 2 ---Zinc ppm 0 4 21 ---Phosphorus ppm 1188 1307 1277 ---Barium ppm 7 0 0 ---Boron ppm 469 421 343 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP443016 [WUSCAR] 06009192 (Generated: 11/30/2023 10:05:54) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Duane Kujat - VP443016
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA 3102253581 - STERNDRIVE\Starboard Gearbox [VPA056587] 05 Sep 2023 @ 932.0 hrs

