
[BRAD HARMON] TIARA BRAD HARMON (S/N NOT GIVEN) - PORT COOLANT
Sample No: VPA036362
Oil Type: VOLVO COOLANT (GREEN)

Steve`s Marine Service West255 S. Ketcham Ave.AMITYVILLE, NYUS  11701Contact: Steven Stavracossteve@stevesmarine.comT: (631)264-1600F: (631).26-4.1601
Diagnosis
The fluid is suitable for furtherservice. There is no indication of anycontamination in the coolant. Glycoland nitrite levels are acceptable. ThepH level of this fluid is within theacceptable limits.

Depot: VP610610Unique No: 10752056Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 22 Nov 2023
Report Id: VP610610 [WUSCAR] 06012912 (Generated: 11/29/2023 23:36:43) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Steven Stavracos - VP610610

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA036362 --- --- ---Sample Date 19 Nov 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITION

pH Scale 0-14 7.86 --- --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm 600 --- --- ---Percentage Glycol % 41.8 --- --- ---Freezing Point °C -15 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Coolant Appearance normal --- --- ---Coolant Color Yllow --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP610610 [WUSCAR] 06012912 (Generated: 11/29/2023 23:36:45) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Steven Stavracos - VP610610
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	TIARA TIARA BRAD HARMON (S/N NOT GIVEN)\Port Coolant [VPA036362] 19 Nov 2023 @ .0 hrs

