
[COREY EAVES [EAVES]] VOLVO PENTA A1147247 - PORT DIESEL ENGINE
Sample No: VPA060028
Oil Type: SHELL ROTELLA T 15W40

McMIchael Yacht Yard No1 Inc700 Rushmore AveMAMARONECK, NYUS  10543Contact: Patti Hornidgerushmore@mcmyacht.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VP153367Unique No: 10752960Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 23 Nov 2023
Report Id: VP153367 [WUSCAR] 06013816 (Generated: 11/23/2023 12:54:18) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Patti Hornidge - VP153367

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA060028 --- --- ---Sample Date 09 Nov 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 150 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 100°C cSt 12.8 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 5.8 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 135 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % NEG --- --- ---Soot % % 0.3 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 48 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 65 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 19 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

Iron ppm 16 --- --- ---Copper ppm 16 --- --- ---Lead ppm 6 --- --- ---Tin ppm 2 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 11 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 2 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 54 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 1091 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 891 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1213 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 989 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 9 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP153367 [WUSCAR] 06013816 (Generated: 11/23/2023 12:54:20) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Patti Hornidge - VP153367
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA A1147247\Port Diesel Engine [VPA060028] 09 Nov 2023 @ 150.0 hrs

