
[TNRO8250A999 [507672]] ZF 20065831 - INBOARD - PORT GEARBOX
Sample No: VPA058657
Oil Type: CHEVRON DELO 400 SAE 30

Marine Maintenance Of7803 McElvey RdPANAMA CITY BEACH, FLUS  32408Contact: Jody Kennedyjody@marinemaint.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. We advisethat you inspect for the source(s) ofwear. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.The aluminum level issevere. The copper level is severe.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. The oil is nolonger serviceable as a result of theabnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: VP313024Unique No: 10762957Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 30 Nov 2023
Report Id: VP313024 [WUSCAR] 06018457 (Generated: 11/30/2023 12:05:35) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Jody Kennedy - VP313024

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA058657 --- --- ---Sample Date 21 Nov 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 900 --- --- ---Oil Hours 250 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 90.2 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % 0.233 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 16 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 36 --- --- ---Iron ppm 99 --- --- ---Copper ppm 738 --- --- ---Lead ppm 15 --- --- ---Tin ppm 4 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 273 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 82 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 2552 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 40 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1063 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1070 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 5 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP313024 [WUSCAR] 06018457 (Generated: 11/30/2023 12:05:37) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Jody Kennedy - VP313024
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	ZF ZF 20065831 - INBOARD\Port Gearbox [VPA058657] 21 Nov 2023 @ 900.0 hrs

