
[SICKENBERGER 460-237] VOLVO PENTA 32000005924 (S/N 3200005924) - PORT IPS
Sample No: VPA058385
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN

Outstanding MarinePO Box 274GALENA, MDUS  21635Contact: Ronda Bolingerrlwb@verizon.netT: F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. Werecommend that you drain the oilfrom the component if this has notalready been done. We recommendan early resample to monitor thiscondition.All component wear ratesare normal. Sodium levels are high.There is a high concentration ofwater present in the oil. The oil is nolonger serviceable due to thepresence of contaminants.

Depot: VP153685Unique No: 10764262Signed: Angela BorellaReport Date: 01 Dec 2023
Report Id: VP153685 [WUSCAR] 06019762 (Generated: 12/01/2023 12:36:45) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Ronda Bolinger - VP153685

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA058385 --- --- ---Sample Date 20 Nov 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 182 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 104 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % 1.29 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 8 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 71 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 4 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 20 --- --- ---Iron ppm 81 --- --- ---Copper ppm 18 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 4 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 2 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 5 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 35 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 467 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 107 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1441 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 209 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP153685 [WUSCAR] 06019762 (Generated: 12/01/2023 12:36:48) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Ronda Bolinger - VP153685
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA 32000005924 (S/N 3200005924)\Port IPS [VPA058385] 20 Nov 2023 @ 182.0 hrs

