
[ESSENNIA-690 NO 42 [JAC]] VOLVO PENTA 3950008953 - STARBOARD IPS
Sample No: VPA059889
Oil Type: VOLVO PENTA GL-5 SAE 75W90

Outstanding MarinePO Box 274GALENA, MDUS  21635Contact: Ronda Bolingerrlwb@verizon.netT: F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. Please specify the brand,type, and viscosity of the oil on yournext sample.All component wearrates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VP153685Unique No: 10764283Signed: Angela BorellaReport Date: 01 Dec 2023
Report Id: VP153685 [WUSCAR] 06019783 (Generated: 12/02/2023 06:08:38) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Ronda Bolinger - VP153685

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA059889 --- --- ---Sample Date 07 Nov 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 160 --- --- ---Oil Hours 110 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 93.4 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 9 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 0 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 11 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 22 --- --- ---Iron ppm 46 --- --- ---Copper ppm 7 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 5 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 52 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 966 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 0 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1617 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 612 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP153685 [WUSCAR] 06019783 (Generated: 12/02/2023 06:08:40) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Ronda Bolinger - VP153685
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA 3950008953\Starboard IPS [VPA059889] 07 Nov 2023 @ 160.0 hrs

