
[JOHN BYRE [6442]] NORTHERN LIGHTS M8441W23 8442-41623C - STARBOARD COOLANT
Sample No: VPA060171
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN

Northwest Diesel Power1325 ROEDER AVE SUITE 103BELLINGHAM, WAUS  98225Contact: BRANDON ROBERTSONparts@nwdieselpower.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
The fluid is suitable for furtherservice. There is no indication of anycontamination in the coolant. Thecarboxylate level of this fluid isacceptable. The glycol level isacceptable. The pH level of this fluidis within the acceptable limits.

Depot: VP759009Unique No: 10765691Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 04 Dec 2023
Report Id: VP759009 [WUSCAR] 06021191 (Generated: 12/11/2023 23:28:42) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRANDON ROBERTSON - VP759009

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA060171 --- --- ---Sample Date 22 Nov 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITION

pH Scale 0-14 8.51 --- --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm NT --- --- ---Percentage Glycol % 44.4 --- --- ---Freezing Point °C -21 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Coolant Appearance normal --- --- ---Coolant Color Pink --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP759009 [WUSCAR] 06021191 (Generated: 12/11/2023 23:28:44) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRANDON ROBERTSON - VP759009
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	NORTHERN LIGHTS NORTHERN LIGHTS M8441W23 8442-41623C\Starboard Coolant [VPA060171] 22 Nov 2023 @ .0 hrs

