
[DARK & STORMY [PB]] 2529052 - PORT DIESEL ENGINE
Sample No: VPA058931
Oil Type: YANMAR 5W40

The Talaria Company202 Banks St., One Little Harbor LandingOXFORD, MDUS  21654Contact: TRACY PELLERINtpellerin@hinckleyyachts.comT: (410)770-4899F:  x:
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: VP592286Unique No: 10778824Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 11 Dec 2023
Report Id: VP592286 [WUSCAR] 06029033 (Generated: 12/11/2023 11:43:31) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TRACY PELLERIN - VP592286

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA058931 VPA041362 VPA031333 VPA032736Sample Date 05 Dec 2023 05 Jan 2023 02 Nov 2021 08 Jan 2021Machine Hours 655 591 554 0Oil Hours 64 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed N/A Not Changd N/ASample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ATTENTION
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 100°C cSt 13.3 13.5 14.3 18.6Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 8.0 8.2 --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 52 52 55 59
 CONTAMINATION

Water % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.7 0.7 1.3 2.1Nitration (PA) % 65 65 76 89Sulfation (PA) % 53 53 58 62Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 4 5 6 8Sodium ppm 1 3 4 4Potassium ppm 5 3 5 11
 WEAR METALS

Iron ppm 16 18 31 39Copper ppm 35 30 47 49Lead ppm 0 1 2 3Tin ppm 0 <1 1 2Aluminum ppm 4 6 9 3Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 1Molybdenum ppm 22 21 19 <1Nickel ppm <1 2 5 6Titanium ppm 0 0 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 0 <1 <1 1Vanadium ppm 0 <1 <1 1
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 1376 1487 1617 1646Magnesium ppm 497 533 600 850Zinc ppm 1059 1083 1098 820Phosphorus ppm 917 929 992 748Barium ppm 3 0 0 0Boron ppm 117 110 106 59

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP592286 [WUSCAR] 06029033 (Generated: 12/11/2023 11:43:33) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TRACY PELLERIN - VP592286
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	YANMAR 2529052\Port Diesel Engine [VPA058931] 05 Dec 2023 @ 655.0 hrs

