
[[JERRE/2612]] VOLVO PENTA 2016138191 - COOLANT
Sample No: VPA039625
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN

Rutt`s Machine Inc.300 Jonlyn DrElizabethtown, PAUS  17022Contact: John Ruttrutt.john@ruttsmachine.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. The fluid is suitable forfurther service. There is no indicationof any contamination in the coolant.The carboxylate level of this fluid isacceptable. The glycol level isacceptable. The pH level of this fluidis within the acceptable limits.

Depot: VP743218Unique No: 10790201Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 20 Dec 2023
Report Id: VP743218 [WUSCAR] 06034972 (Generated: 12/21/2023 06:16:16) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: John Rutt - VP743218

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA039625 --- --- ---Sample Date 07 Dec 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1430 --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITION

pH Scale 0-14 8.00 --- --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm 0 --- --- ---Percentage Glycol % 49.7 --- --- ---Freezing Point °C -33 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Coolant Appearance normal --- --- ---Coolant Color Red --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP743218 [WUSCAR] 06034972 (Generated: 12/21/2023 06:16:18) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: John Rutt - VP743218
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA 2016138191\Coolant [VPA039625] 07 Dec 2023 @ 1430.0 hrs

