
[NADINE URCIUOLI [CELENTANO]] VOLVO PENTA 5103918529Y - INBOARD GEARBOX
Sample No: VPA058274
Oil Type: VOLVO PENTA SAE 15W40

Helmuts Marine Service619 Canal StreetSAN RAFAEL, CAUS  94901-3545Contact: NADINE URCIUOLISERVICE@HELMUTSMARINE.COMT:  x:F:  x:
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.All componentwear rates are normal. Appearance isunacceptable There is a moderateconcentration of water present in theoil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VP152741Unique No: 10791517Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 19 Dec 2023
Report Id: VP152741 [WUSCAR] 06036288 (Generated: 12/21/2023 15:39:19) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: NADINE URCIUOLI - VP152741

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA058274 --- --- ---Sample Date 07 Dec 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 473 --- --- ---Oil Hours 473 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 79.8 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % 0.731 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 9 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 61 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 20 --- --- ---Iron ppm 15 --- --- ---Copper ppm 72 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 0 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 6 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 1387 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 772 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 898 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 838 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 112 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP152741 [WUSCAR] 06036288 (Generated: 12/21/2023 15:39:21) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: NADINE URCIUOLI - VP152741
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA 5103918529Y\Inboard Gearbox [VPA058274] 07 Dec 2023 @ 473.0 hrs

