
[RANES [RANES]] VOLVO PENTA 51220374572 - INBOARD - STARBOARD GEARBOX
Sample No: VPA041198
Oil Type: ATF

Suncoast Diesel Marine Inc.610 Mount Vernan StOLDSMAR, FLUS  34677Contact: MARK WARRENoldsmar@suncoastdmi.comT: (813)475-5942F: (813)475-5943
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.Metal levels are typical for anew component breaking in. There isno indication of any contamination inthe oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VP945077Unique No: 10805830Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 28 Dec 2023
Report Id: VP945077 [WUSCAR] 06045222 (Generated: 12/29/2023 11:34:19) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MARK WARREN - VP945077

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA041198 --- --- ---Sample Date 19 Dec 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 195 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 28.4 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 7 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 24 --- --- ---Iron ppm 83 --- --- ---Copper ppm 135 --- --- ---Lead ppm 4 --- --- ---Tin ppm 2 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 17 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 57 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 336 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 375 --- --- ---Barium ppm 3 --- --- ---Boron ppm 36 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP945077 [WUSCAR] 06045222 (Generated: 12/29/2023 11:34:21) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MARK WARREN - VP945077
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA 51220374572 - INBOARD\Starboard Gearbox [VPA041198] 19 Dec 2023 @ 195.0 hrs

