
[ANDIANIO [MIDI]] ZF I32520311848 - INBOARD - PORT GEARBOX
Sample No: VPA058037
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN

Marine International Diesels Inc.3600 HACIENDA BLVD UNIT GDAVIE, FLUS  33314Contact: JEF BURKEmidijef@gmail.com;canastasio@wearcheckusa.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system.Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. Please specify the brand,type, and viscosity of the oil on yournext sample.All component wearrates are normal. Elemental level ofsilicon (Si) above normal Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VP694356Unique No: 10806985Signed: Angela BorellaReport Date: 28 Dec 2023
Report Id: VP694356 [WUSCAR] 06046377 (Generated: 01/02/2024 11:24:53) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JEF BURKE - VP694356

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA058037 --- --- ---Sample Date 20 Dec 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 13 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 89.2 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 73 --- --- ---Sodium ppm <1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 24 --- --- ---Iron ppm 10 --- --- ---Copper ppm 111 --- --- ---Lead ppm 3 --- --- ---Tin ppm 1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 0 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 3079 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 9 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 875 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 771 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 20 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP694356 [WUSCAR] 06046377 (Generated: 01/02/2024 11:24:58) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JEF BURKE - VP694356
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	ZF ZF I32520311848 - INBOARD\Port Gearbox [VPA058037] 20 Dec 2023 @ 13.0 hrs

