
[DANIEL HUTCHINSON [HUTCH]] JAGUAR HCP12200 - DIESEL ENGINE
Sample No: VPA059537
Oil Type: RAVENOL 0W30

Helmuts Marine Service619 Canal StreetSAN RAFAEL, CAUS  94901-3545Contact: NADINE URCIUOLISERVICE@HELMUTSMARINE.COMT:  x:F:  x:
Diagnosis
The oil is near the end of it`s usefulservice life, recommend schedule anoil change. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. The BN levelis low. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VP152741Unique No: 10832032Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 17 Jan 2024
Report Id: VP152741 [WUSCAR] 06060650 (Generated: 01/22/2024 13:03:02) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: NADINE URCIUOLI - VP152741

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA059537 VPA060181 VPA041594 VPA038597Sample Date 08 Jan 2024 13 Nov 2023 01 Aug 2023 25 Mar 2023Machine Hours 79222 75000 71000 68631Oil Hours 4000 4000 3000 5013Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL MARGINAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 100°C cSt 9.4 9.3 9.63 9.2Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 2.2 1.3 2.5 2.5Oxidation (PA) % 163 189 171 173
 CONTAMINATION

Water % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.3 0.6 0.3 0.6Nitration (PA) % 69 88 73 90Sulfation (PA) % 94 109 100 102Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 4.2 2.8 4.6Silicon ppm 9 7 5 6Sodium ppm 4 13 13 11Potassium ppm <1 5 3 2
 WEAR METALS

Iron ppm 47 108 48 82Copper ppm 2 4 2 4Lead ppm <1 0 <1 0Tin ppm 0 0 <1 0Aluminum ppm 31 70 29 54Chromium ppm 1 3 2 3Molybdenum ppm 73 90 90 78Nickel ppm <1 2 <1 <1Titanium ppm <1 2 1 5Silver ppm 0 0 <1 0Manganese ppm <1 2 1 2Vanadium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 1122 1718 1855 1888Magnesium ppm 444 9 23 10Zinc ppm 804 836 862 926Phosphorus ppm 692 675 718 757Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 81 72 82 72

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP152741 [WUSCAR] 06060650 (Generated: 01/22/2024 13:03:05) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: NADINE URCIUOLI - VP152741
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	JAGUAR JAGUAR HCP12200\Diesel Engine [VPA059537] 08 Jan 2024 @ 79222.0 hrs

