
[MICHAEL RECHITSKY [467995]] VOLVO PENTA A190641 - PORT COOLANT
Sample No: VPA060049
Oil Type: VOLVO COOLANT VCS (YELLOW)

Skipper Bud's215 North Point Drive, 215 North Point DriveWINTHROP HARBOR, ILUS  60096Contact: Oscar M PadillaOPadilla@skipperbuds.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. The fluid is suitable forfurther service. Please note that this isa corrected copy for data entryupdates. There is no indication of anycontamination in the coolant.Carboxylate test failed. The glycollevel is acceptable. The pH level ofthis fluid is within the acceptablelimits.

Depot: VP211714Unique No: 10835334Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 26 Jan 2024
Report Id: VP211714 [WUSCAR] 06063952 (Generated: 01/26/2024 16:24:08) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: Oscar M Padilla - VP211714

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA060049 --- --- ---Sample Date 11 Jan 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITION

pH Scale 0-14 7.91 --- --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm 0 --- --- ---Percentage Glycol % 42.4 --- --- ---Freezing Point °C -17 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Coolant Appearance normal --- --- ---Coolant Color Yllow --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP211714 [WUSCAR] 06063952 (Generated: 01/26/2024 16:24:11) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: Oscar M Padilla - VP211714
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA A190641\Port Coolant [VPA060049] 11 Jan 2024 @ .0 hrs

