
[TY VAN WAVEREN [JAY POUW]] VOLVO PENTA 2061192753 - DIESEL ENGINE
Sample No: VPA051116
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 40

STEWART & STEVENSON FDDA LLC6530 AGNES STCORPUS CHRISTI, TXUS  78406Contact: ARNOLD PALa.pal@ssss.comT: (361)443-9450F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Metallevels are typical for a newcomponent breaking in. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VP1224184Unique No: 10836649Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 22 Jan 2024
Report Id: VP1224184 [WUSCAR] 06065267 (Generated: 01/22/2024 13:22:59) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ARNOLD PAL - VP1224184

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA051116 --- --- ---Sample Date 11 Jan 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 692 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 100°C cSt 13.4 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 8.5 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 61 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % NEG --- --- ---Soot % % 0.4 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 73 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 56 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 10 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 5 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 4 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

Iron ppm 40 --- --- ---Copper ppm 27 --- --- ---Lead ppm 5 --- --- ---Tin ppm 1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 27 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 6 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 1305 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 777 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 995 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 836 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 64 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP1224184 [WUSCAR] 06065267 (Generated: 01/22/2024 13:23:02) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ARNOLD PAL - VP1224184
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA 2061192753\Diesel Engine [VPA051116] 11 Jan 2024 @ 691.7 hrs

