
[JOSEF SZIJARTO [GA]] VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA DP-E - STERNDRIVE (S/N NOT GIVEN) - GEARBOX
Sample No: VPA059787
Oil Type: SHELL

Sea & Ski Marina740 A Ohms WayCOSTA MESA, CAUS  92627Contact: Jeff Cohenwescomarine@gmail.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VP154129Unique No: 10843004Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 23 Jan 2024
Report Id: VP154129 [WUSCAR] 06066327 (Generated: 01/24/2024 06:42:16) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Jeff Cohen - VP154129

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA059787 --- --- ---Sample Date 10 Jan 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 450 --- --- ---Oil Hours 60 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 94.2 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 6 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 7 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

Iron ppm 68 --- --- ---Copper ppm <1 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 6 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 5 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 5 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 5 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1201 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 187 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP154129 [WUSCAR] 06066327 (Generated: 01/24/2024 06:42:18) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Jeff Cohen - VP154129
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA DP-E - STERNDRIVE (S/N NOT GIVEN)\Gearbox [VPA059787] 10 Jan 2024 @ 450.0 hrs

