
[KIMBY [DP C5758]] KIMBY (S/N NOT GIVEN) - STARBOARD TRANSMISSION
Sample No: VPA058090
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 40

Walstrom Marine - 767948501 Bay StreetHARBOR SPRINGS, MIUS  49740Contact: RICK HEINYrheiny@walstrom.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. Resample atthe next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is a moderateconcentration of water present in thefluid. There is a moderate amount ofvisible silt present in the sample. Thecondition of the fluid is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: VP154879Unique No: 10846415Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 26 Jan 2024
Report Id: VP154879 [WUSCAR] 06069738 (Generated: 01/26/2024 14:00:48) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RICK HEINY - VP154879

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA058090 --- --- ---Sample Date 15 Jan 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 4000 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 106 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % 0.520 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 11 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 38 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 4 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 25 --- --- ---Iron ppm 117 --- --- ---Copper ppm 44 --- --- ---Lead ppm 5 --- --- ---Tin ppm 1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 86 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 4 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 2291 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 236 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 985 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 842 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 22 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP154879 [WUSCAR] 06069738 (Generated: 01/26/2024 14:00:50) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RICK HEINY - VP154879
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	KIMBY (S/N NOT GIVEN)\Starboard Transmission [VPA058090] 15 Jan 2024 @ 3999.5 hrs

