
[CLERMONT] VOLVO PENTA 30630390881 - STARBOARD TRANSMISSION
Sample No: VPA051038
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER TRANSMISSION OIL SAE 30

FULL KEEL MARINE SERVICES314 LEGION AVEANNAPOLIS, MDUS  21401Contact: Service ManagerFULLKEELMARINESERIVES@GMAIL.COMT: (410)507-3542F: 
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.The aluminum level isabnormal. All other component wearrates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe fluid. The condition of the fluid isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VP1298996Unique No: 10846785Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 26 Jan 2024
Report Id: VP1298996 [WUSCAR] 06070108 (Generated: 01/26/2024 14:50:22) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Service Manager - VP1298996

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA051038 --- --- ---Sample Date 22 Jan 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1331 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 89.7 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 4 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 4 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 31 --- --- ---Iron ppm 116 --- --- ---Copper ppm 110 --- --- ---Lead ppm 7 --- --- ---Tin ppm 4 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 29 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 88 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 2130 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 15 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 892 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 807 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 4 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP1298996 [WUSCAR] 06070108 (Generated: 01/26/2024 14:50:24) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Service Manager - VP1298996
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA 30630390881\Starboard Transmission [VPA051038] 22 Jan 2024 @ 1331.0 hrs

