
[FOHRMAN [11384]] ZUES/MERCURY 0M971775 - ZUES POD - PORT GEARBOX
Sample No: VPA058519
Oil Type: MERCURY 90W

BAY MARINE3 E MADISON STWAUKEGAN, ILUS  60085Contact: BRENDAN COWHEYbrendan@baymarine.netT: (847)336-2628F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. The oil changeat the time of sampling has beennoted. We advise that you inspect forthe source(s) of wear. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.Gear wear isindicated. There is a highconcentration of water present in theoil. The oil viscosity is higher thannormal. The oil is no longerserviceable due to the presence ofcontaminants.

Depot: VP1174336Unique No: 10859942Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 05 Feb 2024
Report Id: VP1174336 [WUSCAR] 06077851 (Generated: 02/05/2024 16:13:39) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRENDAN COWHEY - VP1174336

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA058519 --- --- ---Sample Date 01 Feb 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 437 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % 24.4 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 5 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 9 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 194 --- --- ---Iron ppm 642 --- --- ---Copper ppm 40 --- --- ---Lead ppm 1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 9 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 9 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 25 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 6 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 10 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 154 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 3 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 45 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 352 --- --- ---Barium ppm 11 --- --- ---Boron ppm 23 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP1174336 [WUSCAR] 06077851 (Generated: 02/05/2024 16:13:41) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRENDAN COWHEY - VP1174336
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	ZUES/MERCURY ZUES/MERCURY 0M971775 - ZUES POD\Port Gearbox [VPA058519] 01 Feb 2024 @ .0 hrs

