
VOLVO PENTA 1013543748 - CENTER DIESEL ENGINE
Sample No: VPA020811
Oil Type: CHEVRON DELO 400 LE 15W40

CHARLESTON NAVIGATION6 CONCORD STREETCHARLESTON, SCUS  29401Contact: David Matashdmatash@charlestonpilots.comT: (843)296-8344F: (843)577-0632
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: VPCHACHAUnique No: 10860862Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 06 Feb 2024
Report Id: VPCHACHA [WUSCAR] 06078771 (Generated: 02/08/2024 08:04:28) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: David Matash - VPCHACHA

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA020811 VPA020710 VPA022613 VPA020423Sample Date 31 Jan 2024 13 Nov 2023 22 Aug 2023 17 May 2023Machine Hours 6951 6476 6000 5490Oil Hours 477 444 500 483Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 100°C cSt 13.4 13.4 13.4 13.1Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 6.5 7.7 6.5 7.2Oxidation (PA) % 65 65 61 70
 CONTAMINATION

Water % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 1.6 0.8 0.9 0.6Nitration (PA) % 72 68 71 70Sulfation (PA) % 70 64 61 66Glycol % NEG NEG 0.0 NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 8 5 6 6Sodium ppm 7 17 95 735Potassium ppm 5 <1 5 31
 WEAR METALS

Iron ppm 48 17 25 24Copper ppm 3 1 7 33Lead ppm 3 2 3 5Tin ppm <1 <1 1 2Aluminum ppm 4 3 4 4Chromium ppm 2 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 114 98 89 122Nickel ppm 2 <1 0 1Titanium ppm <1 0 0 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 1455 1427 1405 1369Magnesium ppm 529 540 471 685Zinc ppm 1493 1115 1258 851Phosphorus ppm 1000 910 990 646Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 315 209 189 222

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VPCHACHA [WUSCAR] 06078771 (Generated: 02/08/2024 08:04:31) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: David Matash - VPCHACHA
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA 1013543748\Center Diesel Engine [VPA020811] 31 Jan 2024 @ 6951.0 hrs

