
[SCHLEHUBER [125085]] SCHLEHUBER (S/N NOT GIVEN) - STARBOARD GEARBOX
Sample No: VPA041170
Oil Type: {unknown}

Diesel Plus2392 Pine Grove RdRinggold, GAUS  31736Contact: MIKE PERKINScustomerservice@dieselplus.comT: (706)866-3619F: (706)608-9020
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor. Pleasespecify the brand, type, and viscosityof the oil on your nextsample.Bearing and/or bushing wearis indicated. All other componentwear rates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VP1287670Unique No: 10872508Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 12 Feb 2024
Report Id: VP1287670 [WUSCAR] 06085063 (Generated: 02/12/2024 15:52:37) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE PERKINS - VP1287670

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA041170 --- --- ---Sample Date 05 Feb 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ATTENTION --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 21.3 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 6 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 9 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 4 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 21 --- --- ---Iron ppm 80 --- --- ---Copper ppm 225 --- --- ---Lead ppm 58 --- --- ---Tin ppm 3 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 183 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 2 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 16 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 307 --- --- ---Barium ppm 17 --- --- ---Boron ppm 88 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP1287670 [WUSCAR] 06085063 (Generated: 02/12/2024 15:52:40) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE PERKINS - VP1287670
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	SCHLEHUBER (S/N NOT GIVEN)\Starboard Gearbox [VPA041170] 05 Feb 2024 @ .0 hrs

