
[NADINE UCIUOLI [LUKAS SIMMONS]] VOLVO PENTA 3101028500 - INBOARD - CENTER GEARBOX
Sample No: VPA051580
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3

Helmuts Marine Service619 Canal StreetSAN RAFAEL, CAUS  94901-3545Contact: NADINE URCIUOLISERVICE@HELMUTSMARINE.COMT:  x:F:  x:
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.The copperlevel is severe. Gear wear is indicated.Clutch disc wear or oil coolerleaching indicated. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The oil is no longerserviceable as a result of theabnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: VP152741Unique No: 10875174Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 15 Feb 2024
Report Id: VP152741 [WUSCAR] 06087729 (Generated: 02/15/2024 12:03:28) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: NADINE URCIUOLI - VP152741

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA051580 --- --- ---Sample Date 05 Feb 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 917 --- --- ---Oil Hours 917 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 103 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 14 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 14 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 7 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 242 --- --- ---Iron ppm 222 --- --- ---Copper ppm 1022 --- --- ---Lead ppm 11 --- --- ---Tin ppm 2 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 96 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 2 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 1 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 8 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 2288 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 10 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 971 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1068 --- --- ---Barium ppm 9 --- --- ---Boron ppm 53 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP152741 [WUSCAR] 06087729 (Generated: 02/15/2024 12:03:30) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: NADINE URCIUOLI - VP152741
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA 3101028500 - INBOARD\Center Gearbox [VPA051580] 05 Feb 2024 @ 917.0 hrs

