
ENCORE I (S/N 3940023264) - STARBOARD MAIN ENGINE
Sample No: VPA042625
Oil Type: DURON 15W30

BAY STATE CRUISE COMPANY200 SEAPORT BLVD, SUITE 50 LOWER LEVELBOSTON, MAUS  02210Contact: CHRISTINE HOOLEYchristine@baystatecruisecompany.comT: (617)775-8418F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: VPBAYBOSUnique No: 10885086Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 20 Feb 2024
Report Id: VPBAYBOS [WUSCAR] 06092233 (Generated: 02/22/2024 11:42:22) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHRISTINE HOOLEY - VPBAYBOS

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA042625 VPA039825 VPA035187 VPA026447Sample Date 05 Apr 2023 02 Aug 2022 16 Sep 2021 14 Jul 2021Machine Hours 5186 4381 3926 3717Oil Hours 225 215 200 200Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL ATTENTION ATTENTION NORMAL
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 100°C cSt 14.6 14.4 10.5 14.3Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.8 9.4 --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 53 55 47 66
 CONTAMINATION

Water % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.1 0.1 0.1 0.1Nitration (PA) % 47 48 42 55Sulfation (PA) % 48 49 47 56Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 0.1 <1.0Silicon ppm 4 3 2 3Sodium ppm 0 1 2 3Potassium ppm 2 1 3 7
 WEAR METALS

Iron ppm 3 6 4 5Copper ppm 2 3 2 2Lead ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 0Aluminum ppm 1 28 1 2Chromium ppm 1 2 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 59 45 2 2Nickel ppm 2 <1 0 0Titanium ppm <1 0 0 <1Silver ppm <1 0 <1 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 1015 1437 1317 2135Magnesium ppm 939 731 18 22Zinc ppm 1182 1144 897 1154Phosphorus ppm 928 1002 736 973Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 5 46 153 247

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VPBAYBOS [WUSCAR] 06092233 (Generated: 02/22/2024 11:42:24) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHRISTINE HOOLEY - VPBAYBOS
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA ENCORE I (S/N 3940023264)\Starboard Main Engine [VPA042625] 05 Apr 2023 @ 5186.0 hrs

