
ENCORE III (S/N 3940025045) - STARBOARD IPS
Sample No: VPA045985
Oil Type: VOLVO API GL-5 SAE 75W90

BAY STATE CRUISE COMPANY200 SEAPORT BLVD, SUITE 50 LOWER LEVELBOSTON, MAUS  02210Contact: CHRISTINE HOOLEYchristine@baystatecruisecompany.comT: (617)775-8418F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VPBAYBOSUnique No: 10885366Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 20 Feb 2024
Report Id: VPBAYBOS [WUSCAR] 06092513 (Generated: 02/22/2024 11:42:31) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHRISTINE HOOLEY - VPBAYBOS

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA045985 VPA040152 VPA035192 VPA040440Sample Date 21 Jun 2023 18 Jul 2022 07 Apr 2022 12 Jan 2022Machine Hours 430 5140 4860 4686Oil Hours 430 500 200 500Oil Changed Changed Changed Not Changd ChangedSample Status NORMAL ATTENTION NORMAL SEVERE
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 99.0 107 109 106
 CONTAMINATION

Water % 0.164 NEG NEG 0.291Silicon ppm 14 20 10 14Sodium ppm 12 30 12 48Potassium ppm 1 2 0 2
 WEAR METALS

PQ 22 18 21 22Iron ppm 174 311 101 554Copper ppm 11 14 5 20Lead ppm 0 <1 0 <1Tin ppm 0 0 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 2 22 8 24Chromium ppm 2 3 1 5Molybdenum ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Nickel ppm 1 0 2 6Titanium ppm 0 0 0 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 <1Manganese ppm 4 4 1 6Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 4 4 3 2Magnesium ppm 3 5 2 7Zinc ppm 46 73 36 87Phosphorus ppm 1372 1389 1314 1421Barium ppm 0 2 0 0Boron ppm 294 363 308 305

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VPBAYBOS [WUSCAR] 06092513 (Generated: 02/22/2024 11:42:34) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHRISTINE HOOLEY - VPBAYBOS
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA ENCORE III (S/N 3940025045)\Starboard IPS [VPA045985] 21 Jun 2023 @ 430.0 hrs

