
[[7306-5068]] VOLVO PENTA 7011446595 - PORT COOLANT
Sample No: VPA029930
Oil Type: VOLVO COOLANT VCS (YELLOW)

STRONGS YACHT CENTER5780 W MILL RDMATTITUCK, NYUS  11952Contact: DERYK ROGERSderyk@strongsmarine.comT: (631)298-4480F: (631)298-4126
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. The fluid is suitable forfurther service. There is no indicationof any contamination in the coolant.Carboxylate test failed. The glycollevel is acceptable. The pH level ofthis fluid is within the acceptablelimits.

Depot: VP1126820Unique No: 10886264Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 22 Feb 2024
Report Id: VP1126820 [WUSCAR] 06093411 (Generated: 02/22/2024 09:31:53) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DERYK ROGERS - VP1126820

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA029930 --- --- ---Sample Date 12 Feb 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 435 --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITION

pH Scale 0-14 7.79 --- --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm NT --- --- ---Percentage Glycol % 49.9 --- --- ---Freezing Point °C -33 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Coolant Appearance normal --- --- ---Coolant Color Yllow --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP1126820 [WUSCAR] 06093411 (Generated: 02/22/2024 09:31:55) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DERYK ROGERS - VP1126820
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA 7011446595\Port Coolant [VPA029930] 12 Feb 2024 @ 435.0 hrs

