
[[D4 NEW JOB]] VOLVO PENTA 2004001916 - PORT DIESEL FUEL
Sample No: VPA052128
Oil Type: {unknown}

ALL SYSTEMS MARINE700 MYRICK STPENSACOLA, FLUS  32505Contact: TRISTAN JOHNSONallsystemsmarine@yahoo.comT: (228)218-7963F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time.All metal levels arenormal indicating no corrosion in thesystem. The water content isnegligible. There is no indication ofany contamination in the fuel. Thecondition of the fuel is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VP99220003Unique No: 10900862Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 01 Mar 2024
Report Id: VP99220003 [WUSCAR] 06102632 (Generated: 03/06/2024 15:08:37) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TRISTAN JOHNSON - VP99220003

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA052128 --- --- ---Sample Date 20 Feb 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1720 --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 FUEL CONDITION

Sulfur ppm 0 --- --- ---Visc @ 40°C cSt 2.95 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % 0.002 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP99220003 [WUSCAR] 06102632 (Generated: 03/06/2024 15:08:37) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TRISTAN JOHNSON - VP99220003
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA 2004001916\Port Diesel Fuel [VPA052128] 20 Feb 2024 @ 1720.1 hrs

