
[[17694]] VOLVO PENTA 3200001632 - CENTER IPS
Sample No: VPA28090
Oil Type: VOLVO PENTA GL-5 SAE 75W90

Diesel Services of America, Inc.2501 West State Road 84FORT LAUDERDALE, FLUS  33312Contact: Dan Rosasdan@dieselservicesofamerica.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.Gear wear isindicated. There is a moderateconcentration of water present in theoil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VP509836Unique No: 10924958Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 14 Mar 2024
Report Id: VP509836 [WUSCAR] 06116125 (Generated: 03/14/2024 10:48:54) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Dan Rosas - VP509836

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA28090 VPA028849 --- ---Sample Date 08 Mar 2024 22 Jul 2021 --- ---Machine Hours 803 80 --- ---Oil Hours 0 80 --- ---Oil Changed N/A Not Changd --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 106 98.8 --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % 0.345 NEG --- ---Silicon ppm 3 5 --- ---Sodium ppm 36 4 --- ---Potassium ppm 2 4 --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 23 18 --- ---Iron ppm 249 20 --- ---Copper ppm 44 11 --- ---Lead ppm 0 0 --- ---Tin ppm 0 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm 8 2 --- ---Chromium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 0 --- ---Nickel ppm 4 2 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 <1 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 4 3 --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 91 25 --- ---Magnesium ppm 5 989 --- ---Zinc ppm 87 9 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1283 1400 --- ---Barium ppm 0 <1 --- ---Boron ppm 220 516 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP509836 [WUSCAR] 06116125 (Generated: 03/14/2024 10:48:55) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Dan Rosas - VP509836
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA 3200001632\Center IPS [VPA28090] 08 Mar 2024 @ 803.0 hrs

