
[PETER SCHEIN [PETER SCHEIN]] VELVET DRIVE PETER SCHEIN - STERNDRIVE (S/N NOT GIVEN) - STARBOARD GEARBOX
Sample No: VPA051676
Oil Type: W1 TMD40A

Helmuts Marine Service619 Canal StreetSAN RAFAEL, CAUS  94901-3545Contact: NADINE URCIUOLISERVICE@HELMUTSMARINE.COMT:  x:F:  x:
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. We advisethat you inspect for the source(s) ofwear. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.Bearing and/or bushingwear is indicated. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The oil is no longerserviceable as a result of theabnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: VP152741Unique No: 10928626Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 19 Mar 2024
Report Id: VP152741 [WUSCAR] 06119793 (Generated: 03/19/2024 18:57:32) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: NADINE URCIUOLI - VP152741

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA051676 --- --- ---Sample Date 07 Mar 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 21.5 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 3 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 30 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 7 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 15 --- --- ---Iron ppm 43 --- --- ---Copper ppm 217 --- --- ---Lead ppm 106 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 6 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 5 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 44 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 19 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 96 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 155 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 42 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP152741 [WUSCAR] 06119793 (Generated: 03/19/2024 18:57:34) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: NADINE URCIUOLI - VP152741
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VELVET DRIVE VELVET DRIVE PETER SCHEIN - STERNDRIVE (S/N NOT GIVEN)\Starboard Gearbox [VPA051676] 07 Mar 2024 @ .0 hrs

