
[NAUMANN, ERICH] VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA IPS600E (S/N NOT GIVEN) - STARBOARD IPS
Sample No: VPA054425
Oil Type: VOLVO PENTA GL-5 SAE 75W90

ERICH NAUMANN15209 97TH COURT NEBOTHELL, WAUS  98011Contact: ERICH BOTHELLerichbnaumann@aol.comT: (206)383-7132F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Oil and filter change atthe time of sampling has been noted.Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is a lightconcentration of water present in theoil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: ERIBOTUnique No: 10935915Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 21 Mar 2024
Report Id: ERIBOT [WUSCAR] 06121764 (Generated: 03/21/2024 16:29:31) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ERICH BOTHELL - ERIBOT

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA054425 --- --- ---Sample Date 10 Mar 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 42 --- --- ---Oil Hours 42 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 107 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % 0.236 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 9 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 10 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 28 --- --- ---Iron ppm 172 --- --- ---Copper ppm 6 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 2 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 11 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 3 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 13 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1240 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 278 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: ERIBOT [WUSCAR] 06121764 (Generated: 03/21/2024 16:29:33) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ERICH BOTHELL - ERIBOT
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA IPS600E (S/N NOT GIVEN)\Starboard IPS [VPA054425] 10 Mar 2024 @ 42.0 hrs

